

EXHIBIT B
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category Group Pricing - Discounts

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.

Category Group	Categories and Subcategories	Discount Off List/ Catalog	Name of Catalog or Price List	Date Published
Group 1	Air Filters and Filter Media	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Pleated, High Capacity	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Pleated, Standard Capacity	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Bag Filters	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Box Filters	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Poly Media	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	HEPA Filters	20%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Gas Phase	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
Group 2	Hand Tools, Power Tools and Accessories			
	<i>Hand Tools</i>	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Ames True Temper	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Ampco Non-Sparking Tools	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Apex	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Armstrong Tools	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Blackhawk	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Channellock	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Crescent	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Empire Level	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	K-D	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Keson	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Klein	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Reed	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Ridgid	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Stanley	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Vise Grip	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Waterloo	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Williams	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Craftsman	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Snap-On	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Hilti	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Accessories	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	<i>Power Tools</i>	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Black and Decker	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Milwaukee Electrical Tool Corp	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Robert Bosch Tool Corp	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	MK Morse Co.	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Irwin Industrial Tool Co	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Chicago Pneumatic	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Dewalt	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Dremel	0%	.	xx/xx/xx

Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment

Category Group Pricing - Discounts

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.

Category Group	Categories and Subcategories	Discount Off List/ Catalog	Name of Catalog or Price List	Date Published
	Enerpac	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Fein	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Hitachi	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Jet	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Lenox	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Makita	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Sioux Air Tools (Force)	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Sioux Air Tools (Industrial)	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Skil	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Craftsman	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Snap-On	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Hilti	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Accessories	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
Group 4	Electrical	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Electrical Equipment	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Electrical Wiring	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Electrical Supplies	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
Group 5	Heating, Venting, Air Conditioning/Refrigeration	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Heating Equipment	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Air Conditioning Equipment	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	HVAC Supplies	15%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
Group 6	Plumbing	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Pipe - Metal	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Pipe- Plastic/PVC	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Fixtures	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Faucets	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Supplies	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
Group 7	Janitorial/Cleaning	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Disposable Paper	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Plastic Liners	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Cleaning Chemicals	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Equipment (electrical)	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Equipment (battery operated)	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
	Supplies	25%	SEXAUER LIST PRICE	05/01/14
Group 9	Food Services Supplies	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Paper Supplies	0%	.	xx/xx/xx
	Plastic Supplies	0%	.	xx/xx/xx

end

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 1 - Air Filters

Sequence	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
1	Bag filter, 20x20x22, MERV 11	122161	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 49.06	\$ 25.41	48%
2	Bag filter, 24x24x21, MERV 15	291491	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 33.47	\$ 17.68	47%
3	Box filter, 24x24x12, MERV 14	291494	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 85.16	\$ 44.95	47%
4	Box filter, 24x24x4, MERV 15, with antimicrobial (treatment)	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	
5	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 10x30x1 MERV8	291315	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 7.99	\$ 3.98	50%
6	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 12x24x2, MERV8	783666	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 7.64	\$ 2.41	68%
7	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 16x20x2, MERV8	783667	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 6.75	\$ 2.75	59%
8	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 16x25x2, MERV10	755622	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 15.67	\$ 7.71	51%
9	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 16x25x2, MERV8	783668	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 7.82	\$ 3.20	59%
10	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 20x20x1 MERV8	460511	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 8.30	\$ 3.21	61%
11	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 20x20x2, MERV8	783669	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 7.77	\$ 3.15	59%
12	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 20x24x2, MERV8	291479	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 7.44	\$ 3.34	55%
13	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 20x25x2, MERV8	783670	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 9.28	\$ 3.65	61%
14	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 24x24x2, MERV8	783671	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 9.32	\$ 3.67	61%
15	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 24x24x4, MERV8	291482	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	6	6	\$ 16.31	\$ 7.32	55%
16	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 8-3/4x24-1/8x1, MERV8	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
17	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 8-3/4x33-5/8x1, MERV8	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
18	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 8-7/8x19/1/8x1, MERV8	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
19	Filter- high capacity, pleated, 9-1/2x37-1/2x1, MERV8	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
20	Filter- ring panel, 10x28, MERV6	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
21	Filter- ring panel, 13x77-1/2, MERV6	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
22	Filter- ring panel, 24x48, 2ply, MERV6	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 1 - Air Filters

Sequence	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/ Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
23	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 10x36x1, MERV7	106830	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 9.81	\$ 7.49	24%
24	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 16x20x2 MERV8	783649	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 3.78	\$ 2.31	49%
25	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 16x20x2, MERV7	783649	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 3.78	\$ 2.31	49%
26	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 16x25x1, MERV7	783650	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 4.53	\$ 2.49	45%
27	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 16x25x2 MERV8	783656	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 5.49	\$ 2.72	50%
28	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 16x25x4, MERV7	291464	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	6	6	\$ 12.93	\$ 5.80	55%
29	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 20x20x1, MERV7	783651	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 4.32	\$ 2.58	40%
30	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 20x20x2 MERV8	783657	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 4.92	\$ 2.75	44%
31	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 20x25x2, MERV8	783658	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 6.50	\$ 3.14	52%
32	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 20x25x4, MERV7	291469	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	6	6	\$ 13.71	\$ 6.05	56%
33	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 24x24x2, MERV8	783659	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 6.35	\$ 3.15	50%
34	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 24x24x4, MERV7	291471	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	6	6	\$ 14.13	\$ 6.35	55%
35	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 25x25x2, MERV7	798019	FLANDERS	.	N/A	each	12	12	\$ 8.52	\$ 3.73	56%
36	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 9-1/2x24x1, MERV7	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%
37	Filter- standard capacity, pleated, 9-1/2x48x1, MERV7	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	0%

[illegible]

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 2 - Tools - Hand Tools, Power Tools and Accessories

Sequence	SKU Description (In alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
Hand Tools											
1	Crayon, Lumber, PK12	461303	LA-CO INDUSTRIAL	N/A	N/A	each	144	12	\$ 1.68	\$ 0.60	64%
2	Fork, Promotional Manure 5-Tine	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	.
3	Hand Ratchet, 1/2 In Dr, 10 In L, Round	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	.
4	Plier - Long Nose Plier w/Cutter, 7 1/2 In	2464535	CHANNELLOCK	N/A	N/A	each	20	1	\$ 31.25	\$ 14.98	52%
5	Plier- Fence Tool Plier, 1 1/16 Lx3 5/8 In W Jaw	.	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	.
6	Plier, Tongue/Groove, 10 In	457914	CHANNELLOCK	N/A	N/A	each	20	1	\$ 16.98	\$ 10.97	35%
7	Plier, Tongue/Groove, 12 In	457915	CHANNELLOCK	N/A	N/A	each	20	1	\$ 20.78	\$ 12.43	40%
8	Putty Knife, Stiff, 2 In, Plastic/Rubber	302469	WARNER TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	5	1	\$ 5.57	\$ 3.22	42%
9	Rake, 24-Tine Spring Brace	287471	SEYMOUR MFG.	N/A	N/A	each	12	1	\$ 11.03	\$ 5.44	51%
10	Rip Hammer, Fiberglass, 20 Oz	286737	STANLEY TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	2	1	\$ 34.76	\$ 18.54	47%
11	Screwdriver- Multi-Bit Screwdriver, 15-n-	322859	MEGAPRO	N/A	N/A	each	50	1	\$ 27.51	\$ 16.14	41%
12	Screwdriver, Phillips #2 x 4, Cushion	454815	KLEIN TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 12.61	\$ 7.01	44%
13	Screwdriver, Slotted, 5/16x6 In, Sq Shank	454812	KLEIN TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 12.15	\$ 6.82	44%
14	Screwdriver/Nut Driver, 11-In-1	799604	KLEIN TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 15.12	\$ 13.20	13%
15	Shovel, D-Handle 16" Drain Spade	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	.
16	Shovel, Long Handle Square Point	286993	SEYMOUR MFG.	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 10.48	\$ 5.17	51%
17	Shovel, Scoop Fiberglass LH D-GRIP	287467	SEYMOUR MFG.	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 54.40	\$ 26.82	51%
18	Shovel, Snow Pusher 18" Combo	287475	SEYMOUR MFG.	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 24.89	\$ 12.28	51%
19	Tape Measure, 1 In x 25 ft, Chrome, In/Ft	2465388	KESON INDUSTRIES	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 19.82	\$ 9.35	53%
20	Tool Box, HD, 26x8 3/4x10 1/2	286936	STANLEY TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	2	1	\$ 41.18	\$ 21.96	47%
21	Utility Knife, Retractable, 3 Blades	293178	WARNER TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	10	1	\$ 4.82	\$ 2.24	54%
22	Wall Scraper, 3 Stiff- Wood Handle - STANLEY	147488	KARMICHAEL INDUSTRIES	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 9.30	\$ 3.55	62%
23	Wire Stripper, 7 1/8 In	454808	KLEIN TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	6	1	\$ 31.24	\$ 16.92	46%
24	Torque Rtrch Hd Wrench	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	1	\$ -	\$ -	.
25	Combination - Ratcheting Wrench Set	286989	STANLEY TOOL	N/A	N/A	each	2	1	\$ 35.90	\$ 19.56	46%
Power Tools and Accessories											
26	Battery Pack, 18V Twin HD XRP	298410	DEWALT	N/A	N/A	each	4	1	\$ 134.26	\$ 126.75	6%
27	Battery Pack, 18V Twin HD XRP	298410	DEWALT	N/A	N/A	each	4	1	\$ 134.26	\$ 126.75	6%

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 2 - Tools - Hand Tools, Power Tools and Accessories

[illegible]

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 4 - Electrical Repairs and Equipment

Sequence	SKU Description alphabetical order)	(in	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
1	Cable Tie- 4" 18lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 w/Stainless Steel Locking Device		NO BID				each				.	.
2	Cable Tie- 5.5" 30lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 w/Stainless Steel Locking Device		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
3	Cable Tie- 5.6" 30lb Tensile Natural Nylon 6.6 Bulk		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
4	Cable Tie- 7" 50lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 w/Stainless Steel Locking Device Bulk		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
5	Cable Tie- 7 X .091 Black, TY-RAP		NO BID				Pk	.	.	\$ -	.	.
6	Cable Tie- 8" 30lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 Intermediate w/Stainless Steel Locking Device		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
7	Cable Tie- 8" 50lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 Standard Barb-Ty Locking Cable Tie w/Metal Tab		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
8	Cable Tie- 8.19" L, Black, TY-RAP		NO BID	.	.	.	Pk	.	.	\$ -	.	.
9	Cable Tie- 11" 50lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 w/Stainless Steel Locking Device		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
10	Cable Tie- 11" 50lb Tensile Natural Nylon 6.6 Power Phase Locking Cable Tie		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
11	Cable Tie- 11.4"L, Black, TY-RAP		711849	Sexauer	n/a	n/a	500	Pk	1	\$ 39.89	\$ 9.86	75%
12	Cable Tie- 13" 120lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 Heavy Duty Tie w/Stainless Steel Locking Device Bulk		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
13	Cable Tie- 14.2" 120lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
14	Cable Tie- 14.5" 120lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 Power Phase Heavy Duty		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
15	Cable Tie- 18" 120lb Tensile Black Nylon 6.6 Heavy Duty Connector- 12-10 AWG Power Phase Yellow Polyolefin		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
16	Sealed Crimp Butt Splice Connector		BN-630512	NSI Industries	n/a	n/a	50	Pk	1	\$ 18.18	\$ 2.64	85%
17	Connector- 12-10 Wire 1.61" Length Nylon Insulated Butt Splice Connector Double Crimp		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
18	Connector- 16-14 AWG Power Phase Blue Polyolefin Sealed Crimp Butt Splice Connector		460926	NSI Industries	n/a	n/a	50	Pk	1	\$ 11.75	\$ 2.44	79%

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 4 - Electrical Repairs and Equipment

Sequence	SKU Description alphabetical order)	(in	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
19	Connector- 16-14 Wire 1.25" Length Nylon Insulated Butt Splice Connector Double Crimp		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
20	Connector- 22-16 Wire 1.25" Length Nylon Insulated Butt Splice Connector Double Crimp		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
21	Connector- 22-18 AWG Power Phase Red Polyolefin Sealed Crimp Butt Splice Connector		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
22	Contact Block, 1NC Slow Break, 22mm		S/O ZBE102	Schneider Elec	n/a	n/a	each	.	.	\$ 23.34	\$ 17.50	25%
23	Counter, Mechanical, 4 Digit, Hand Tally		S/O M45	ENM	n/a	n/a	each	.	.	\$ 18.56	\$ 13.92	25%
24	Electrical Box- Handy Mini Box, 7.3 Cu In		S/O 640	Raco	n/a	n/a	each	30	30	\$ 12.49	\$ 9.37	25%
25	Electrical Box, Square, 4x4x2, 30.3 Cu-In		458542	Hubbell	n/a	n/a	each	25	1	\$ 3.84	\$ 0.97	75%
26	Electrical Tape- 130C 1"X30' 3M Electrical Tape-Rubber		442905	Intertape	n/a	n/a	each	100	1	\$ 7.82	\$ 2.79	64%
27	EMT Connector- 1" Insulated EMT RAINTGHT Conduit		342105	Kaf-Tech	n/a	na	each	100'	100'	\$ 2.27	\$ 1.09	52%
28	EMT Connector, 1/2 In Non-Insulated		BN-623085	Topaz Elect	n/a	n/a	each	50	1	\$ 1.21	\$ 0.28	77%
29	Ethernet Cable, Cat 6, 5 Ft, Yellow, 24AWG		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
30	Ethernet Cable, Cat6, 7 Ft, Yellow, 24AWG		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
31	Ethernet Cable, Cat 6, 10 Ft, Yellow, 24AWG		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
32	Ethernet Cable, Cat 6, 30 Ft, Yellow, 24AWG		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
33	Extension Cord, 10 Ft		BN-647305	Coleman Cable	n/a	n/a	each	24	1	\$ 7.01	\$ 3.28	53%
34	Extension Cord, 25 Ft		464898	Coleman Cable	n/a	n/a	each	12	1	\$ 33.23	\$ 10.41	69%
35	Extension Cord, 25 Ft, Single Connector		464897	Coleman Cable	n/a	n/a	each	12	1	\$ 33.23	\$ 15.49	53%
36	Extension Cord, 50 Ft		464902	Coleman Cable	n/a	n/a	each	1	1	\$ 29.74	\$ 13.83	53%
37	Extension Cord, 50 Ft, 12/3 SJT, Vinyl		464900	Coleman Cable	n/a	n/a	each	6	1	\$ 59.99	\$ 27.89	54%
38	Fuse, 10A, Nonindicating, ATM, 32VDC		1028195	Cooper Bussm	n/a	n/a	each	1	1	\$ 0.67	\$ 0.42	37%
39	Outlet Strip, 6 Outlets, Putty		459751	Hubbell	n/a	n/a	each	1	1	\$ 68.63	\$ 36.34	47%
40	Patch Cord, 14 Ft, Cat6, Yellow		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
41	Patch Cord, 20 Ft, Cat 6, Yellow		NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	.	.
42	Pipe Clamp, Grounding, 1/2-1 In, Bronze		BN-461527	Thomas & Bett	n/a	n/a	each	100	1	\$ 4.25	\$ 2.33	45%
43	Plate, Wall, 1 Gang, Silver		459555	Hubbell	n/a	n/a	each	100	10	\$ 2.15	\$ 1.01	53%

[illegible]

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 5 - Heating, Ventilation, and Air Conditioning (HVAC)

Sequence	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
1	Air Circulator, 20 In, 3650 cfm, 115V	16333334	AIR MASTER F	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 139.23	\$ 133.50	4%
2	Air Conditioner, 115V Single Phase, 13,200BTU Portable	302242	COMFORT AIR	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 559.06	\$ 443.75	21%
3	Air Conditioner, 26"W 24000 BTU 1600SqFt Coverage Kuhl Heat/Cool Window Air Conditioner	302234	COMFORT AIR	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 910.00	\$ 623.75	31%
4	Air Vent, Float, Max Operating PSI 75	111526	HOFFMAN SPE	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 97.50	\$ 78.63	19%
5	Ball Joint, Crank Arm Ball Joint, Dia 5/16 In	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	
6	Cleaner, Alkaline Based Coil Cleaner, 1 Gal, Blue	443861	DIVERSITECH	N/A	N/A	each	4	1	\$ 15.98	\$ 7.98	50%
7	Cleaner, Coil Cleaner, No Rinse, Aerosol, 18 Oz	756480	DIVERSITECH	N/A	N/A	each	12	1	\$ 25.38	\$ 14.38	43%
8	Cleaner, Condenser Coil Cleaner, Enviro Green, 1 G	756475	DIVERSITECH	Meets the	N/A	each	4	1	\$ 23.34	\$ 12.84	45%
9	Dehumidifier, 50pt Front Bucket Continuous Drain Energy Star w/Built-In Drain Pump	1028312	MIDEA ELECTRO	ENERGY STAR	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 303.99	\$ 174.10	43%
10	Dehumidifier, BHD-501-D 50Pts./Day 5.6 Amps 630 Watt Energy Star Portable	70-0800	HEAT CONTROL	ENERGY STAR	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 297.57	\$ 196.25	34%
11	Diffuser, 3-Cone, Duct Size 8 In., White	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	
12	Fan, Axial Fan, 115VAC, 4-11/16In H, 4-11/16In W	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	
13	Fan, Pedestal Fan, Wh, 1950/1680/1380 cfm, 18in.	463366	AIR KING	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 58.71	\$ 50.37	14%
14	Fan, Portable BoxFan, Non-Osc, 20 In, 3-spd, 120V	463372	AIR KING	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 34.83	0%
15	Fan, Table Fan, Oscillating, 12 In Dia, 3-speed, 120V	463374	AIR KING	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 51.01	\$ 31.71	38%
16	Fan, Wall Mount Fan, 1510/1380/1190 cfm, 16 in.	463363	AIR KING	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 61.62	\$ 46.13	25%
17	Fan, Wall Mount Fan, 1970/1520/1170 cfm, 18 in.	463364	AIR KING	N/A	N/A	each	1	1	\$ 82.92	\$ 52.28	37%
18	Heat Pump, 13300H/14500C 208/230V Digital Heat Pump PTAC	NO BID	.	.	.	each	.	.	\$ -	\$ -	

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 5 - Heating, Ventilation, and Air Conditioning (HVAC)

[illegible]

[illegible]

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 7 - Janitorial/Cleaning (and Dispensers)

Sequence	Product Type	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/ Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
1	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Natural Towel Universal Hand Roll - Tork	SCA290088	SCA	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/700ct =	1 case	\$ 95.75	\$ 29.68	69%
2	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, White Enmotion High Capacity TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Universal - Tork	GPT89480	Georgia Pacific	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 98.81	\$ 40.51	59%
3	DP		SCA115500	SCA	N/A	100% Paper	case	96rls/500sh	1 case	\$ 86.00	\$ 25.80	70%
4	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Natural BW ECOSOFT GS	REN06130-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 63.95	\$ 27.50	57%
5	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Natural BW ECOSOFT Green Seal UNIV	SCARK8002	SCA	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 58.75	\$ 17.04	71%
6	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply BW ECOSOFT Controlled Use, Green Seal	REN06125-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	36rls/865ft	1 case	\$ 74.98	\$ 29.99	60%
7	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Natural BW ECOSOFT GS	REN06131-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 68.57	\$ 28.11	59%
8	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Brown Cormatic Towel Hardwound On 8.25in Non Slot	GPT2910P	Georgia Pacific	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	6rls/700ft =	1 case	\$ 76.86	\$ 28.44	63%
9	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Scott JRT JR Jumbo	SCATJ0922A	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	12rls/1000f	1 case	\$ 67.25	\$ 20.18	70%
10	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, White Enmotion	GPT89460	Georgia Pacific	N/A	N/A	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 126.00	\$ 42.84	66%
11	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, White Tork Towel Advanced Hand Roll	SCA290089	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	6rls/700ct =	1 case	\$ 106.00	\$ 33.92	68%
12	DP	Paper Towel- Multifold, White Tork Towel Hand	APP12502-WB	Wausau	N/A	100% Paper	case	16pk/250ct	1 case	\$ 33.34	\$ 15.00	55%
13	DP	Paper Towel- Multifold, Natural Tork Towel Hand Universal	GPT23304	Georgia Pacific	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	16pk/250ct	1 case	\$ 45.76	\$ 13.27	71%
14	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply, Adv Mini Jumbo- Tork	SCA12024402	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	12rls/751ft	1 case	\$ 81.38	\$ 25.23	69%
15	DP	Napkin- Universal Xpressnap® Napkin Dispenser Interfold- Natural - Tork	SCADX906E	SCA	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	12Pk/500ct	1 case	\$ 93.41	\$ 35.50	62%
16	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Rollmaster Hi Capacity 4x4.05	GPT19027	Georgia Pacific	N/A	N/A	case	48rls/770sh	1 case	\$ 124.50	\$ 38.60	69%
17	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Cormatic Shell Embossed 3.95x4.05	GPT2520	Georgia Pacific	N/A	N/A	case	36rl/1000sh	1 case	\$ 99.62	\$ 34.87	65%

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 7 - Janitorial/Cleaning (and Dispensers)

Sequence	Product Type	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
18	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, White Renown Towel Control Hard Roll	REN06131-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 68.57	\$ 28.11	59%
19	DP	Paper Towel- Roll Brown enMotion	GPT89480	Georgia Pacific	Green Seal	100% Paper	PK	6rls/800ft =	1 case	\$ 98.81	\$ 40.51	59%
20	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Renown Single Roll 3-7/8x4 3 7/8x4	REN06126-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	48rls/616sh	1 case	\$ 75.39	\$ 29.40	61%
21	DP	Paper Towel- Kitchen Towel, White, Perforated Roll	SCAHB1990A	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	30rls/84she	1 case	\$ 53.75	\$ 17.20	68%
22	DP	Paper Towel- C-Fold, White igfold Z Prem	GPT20887	Georgia Pacific	N/A	N/A	case	10pk/220ct	1 case	\$ 68.99	\$ 22.08	68%
23	DP	Napkin- Universal Napkin Dispenser Betsy Tallfold - White - Tork	SCAD3052B	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	16Pk/625ct	1 case	\$ 98.25	\$ 21.62	78%
24	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply High-Capacity-Tork	SCA110292A	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	36rl/1000sh	1 case	\$ 109.13	\$ 34.92	68%
25	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply BW ECOSOFT Controlled Use	REN06126-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	48rls/616sh	1 case	\$ 75.39	\$ 29.40	61%
26	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Compact Coreless HI-CAP	GPT19378	Georgia Pacific	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	18rls/1500s	1 case	\$ 43.66	\$ 28.38	35%
27	DP	Paper Towel- Roll, Natural Universal Hand Roll-Tork	SCARK350A	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	12rls/350ft	1 case	\$ 49.25	\$ 14.78	70%
28	DP	TP- Bath Tissue, Roll, White, 2-ply Clean & Soft	REN06148-WB	Wausau	Green Seal	100% Paper	case	80rls/500sh	1 case	\$ 71.19	\$ 27.05	62%
29	DP	Facial Tissue, Tork Univ Flat Box, White	SCATF6710A	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	30 bx/100sl	1 case	\$ 58.00	\$ 13.34	77%
30	DP	Wiper- Wypall L40 Ind Wiper 1/4 Fold 12.5x13 - White	KCC05701	Kimberly Clark	N/A	N/A	case	18pk/56ct =	1 case	\$ 159.43	\$ 35.08	78%
31	DP	Paper Towel- C-Fold, White Decor Towel Center-Fold	SCACB530	SCA	EcoLogo	100% Paper	case	16pk/150ct	1 case	\$ 58.13	\$ 14.53	75%
32	DP	Pad- Folded Maxi 4" Pad Vender Box	HOSA-147	Hospeco	N/A	N/A	case	250ct	1 case	\$ 45.43	\$ 22.26	51%
33	DP	Tampon, Tampax Regular, Vendor Tube	HOST500	Hospeco	N/A	N/A	case	500ct	1 case	\$ 91.46	\$ 49.39	46%
34	J	Soap, Foam Soap, 1250 ML Pink Lotion Hand Soap	SBSAZU1L	DEB	Green Seal	N/A	case	6ct-1000ml	1 Each	\$ 70.85	\$ 30.48	57%
35	J	Cleaner- SOLSTA 710 Multi-Purpose Disinfectant- 3 Liter	SPA4704	Spartan	N/A	N/A	case	4ct/2ltr =8L	1 Each	\$ 140.12	\$ 61.64	56%
36	J	Mop- Blue Wonder Janitor- large	RCPD21306BL	Rubbermaid	N/A	N/A	case	6	1 Each	\$ 69.60	\$ 18.78	73%

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 7 - Janitorial/Cleaning (and Dispensers)

Sequence	Product Type	SKU Description (In alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/ Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
37	J	Cleaner- SPARTAN Clean by Peroxy - 1 Gal	SPA0035-04	Spartan	Green Seal	N/A	case	4	1 case	\$ 76.88	\$ 39.96	48%
38	J	Soap- Foam Soap, 1200 ML Purple	SBSREW120TF	DEB	Green Seal	N/A	PK	3ct/1200ml	1 Each	\$ 80.50	\$ 33.81	58%
39	J	Soap- Foam Soap, 1250 MLGreen Certified	SBSCLR11L	DEB	Green Seal	N/A	CS	6ct/1000ml	1 Each	\$ 72.62	\$ 31.20	57%
40	J	Filter Bags- Micro Lined For Super Coach Vacuum	REN08051	Renown	N/A	N/A	PK	10	1 PK	\$ 11.69	\$ 4.09	65%
41	J	Soap- Antibacterial Hand Soap - 1 Gal	REN02504	Renown	N/A	N/A	case	4	1 Each	\$ 50.76	\$ 26.40	48%
42	J	Soap- Foam Soap, 1250 ML Anti-microbial Hand Soap	SBSDMAMCA11L	DEB	N/A	N/A	case	6ct/1000ml	1 Each	\$ 116.00	\$ 48.72	58%
43	J	Cleaner- SPARTAN Super HDQ Neutral- 1 Gal	SPA1204-04	Spartan	N/A	N/A	case	4	1 Each	\$ 125.40	\$ 53.92	57%
44	J	Cleaner- SOLSTA 255 All Purpose Cleaner- 3 Liter	SPA4820	Spartan	N/A	N/A	case	4	1 Each	\$ 85.68	\$ 41.96	51%
45	J	Waste Basket- 3540 - 23 GL Slim Jim - RECYCLE - Blue	CON8322-1	Continental	N/A	N/A	each	1	1 Each	\$ 54.23	\$ 22.78	58%
46	L	Liner 38x58 1.7mil 55 Gal Black	REPSB-60-170	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 57.26	\$ 24.62	57%
47	L	Liner 38x63 2.5ml Opaque Orange	REPDO63-250	Republic Bag	N/A	N/A	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 117.77	\$ 45.93	61%
48	L	Liner 43x47 1.2mil 56 Gal Black	REPSB-47-120	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 case	\$ 38.18	\$ 16.42	57%
49	L	Liner 43X48 16 MIC Natural Roll	IGLVALH4348N1	Inteplast	N/A	N/A	case	200ct	1 Case	\$ 42.15	\$ 17.70	58%
50	L	Liner 50x48 1.7mil King Can Black	REPSB-5048-170	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 75.50	\$ 27.18	64%
51	L	Liner 33x40 1.7mil 33 Gal Black	REPSB-40-170	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 34.30	\$ 14.75	57%
52	L	Liner 43x47 1.7mil 56 Gal Black	REPSB-47-170	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 63.57	\$ 22.89	64%
53	L	Liner 33x39 14mic - Natural Can Value Hi-D	TYCVLH3340-16	Berry Plastics	N/A	N/A	case	10rls/25ct =	1 Case	\$ 39.37	\$ 14.17	64%
54	L	Liner 24x31 7mic - Natural Can Value Hi-D	TYCVLH2433-08	Berry Plastics	N/A	N/A	case	20rls/50ct =	1 Case	\$ 38.59	\$ 14.28	63%
55	L	Liner 33x39 2.5ml Opaque Orange	REPD039-250	Republic Bag	N/A	N/A	case	150ct	1 Case	\$ 90.93	\$ 37.28	59%
56	L	Liner 43X47 1.5 MIL Black MAX	REN65613-RL	Berry Plastics	N/A	N/A	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 56.95	\$ 20.50	64%
57	L	Liner 38X63 Black (60 Gal) 2.7mil	TYCLB03863X58	Berry Plastics	N/A	10% PCW Pl	case	50ct	1 Case	\$ 69.06	\$ 23.48	66%
58	L	Liner 40x46 1.7mil 40-45 Gal Black	REPSB-46-170	Republic Bag	N/A	40% Plastic	case	100ct	1 Case	\$ 57.62	\$ 20.74	64%
59	L	Liner 40x46 19mic - Black Can Value Hi-D	TYCVLH4048-22	Berry Plastics	N/A	N/A	case	150ct	1 Case	\$ 44.29	\$ 15.94	64%
60	L	Liner 24X33 08N Coreless Roll Natural	REPEN243308CF	Republic Bag	N/A	N/A	case	20rls/50ct =	1 case	\$ 35.50	\$ 19.53	45%
Dispensers												

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 7 - Janitorial/Cleaning (and Dispensers)

[illegible]

EXHIBIT B
INTERLINE BRANDS, INC.
Maintenance, Repairs and Operations (MRO) - Facilities Supplies and Equipment
Category 9 - Food Service Supplies

Sequence	SKU Description (in alphabetical order)	Bidder's SKU	Bidder's Manufacturer	GREEN	Recycled Content	Unit of Measure	Quantity in Case/ Package	Minimum Order Quantity	List Price	Net State Price	Applied Discount from List
1	Bowl Foam 10 Oz White	DCC10820	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 61.59	\$ 31.41	49%
2	Cling Classic 12in	AEP7301235	AEP Ind.	N/A	N/A	case	2000 ft	1 Roll	\$ 19.32	\$ 7.73	60%
3	Cling Classic 18in	AEP7301835	AEP Ind.	N/A	N/A	case	2000 ft	1 Roll	\$ 24.29	\$ 11.66	52%
4	Container Foam Food 4 oz White	DCC4J6	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 33.15	\$ 16.91	49%
5	Container Foam Food 8 oz White	DCC8SJ20	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 59.21	\$ 30.20	49%
6	Container Foam Food White	DCC16MJ20	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	500/ct	1 Case	\$ 39.92	\$ 20.76	48%
7	Container Foam Squat 12 Oz White	DCC12SJ20	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	500/ct	1 Case	\$ 37.67	\$ 18.08	52%
8	Cup 3-1/4 - 4 Oz Portion Clear	SOLP400	Solo (Dart)	N/A	N/A	case	2500/ct	1 Case	\$ 160.06	\$ 36.81	77%
9	Cup Cone Paper White 4oz	SOL4R-2050	Solo (Dart)	ASTM-D68	70% Plant Based	case	5000/ct	1 Case	\$ 104.98	\$ 39.89	62%
10	Cup Flush Bottom Water 3 Oz	DIX45PATH	Dixie	N/A	N/A	case	2400/ct	1 Case	\$ 101.62	\$ 35.57	65%
11	Cup Foam J Style 12 Oz White	DCC12J12	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 53.09	\$ 23.36	56%
12	Cup Foam J Style 6 Oz White	DCC6J6	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 27.52	\$ 14.04	49%
13	Cup Foam J Style 8 Oz White	DCC8J8	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 44.10	\$ 16.32	63%
14	Cup Paper Hot 8 Oz White	SOL378W-2050	Solo (Dart)	FSC or SFI	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 82.06	\$ 32.82	60%
15	Cup Portion 5.5 Oz Clear	SOLUR55-0100	Solo (Dart)	N/A	N/A	case	2500/ct	1 Case	\$ 114.62	\$ 44.70	61%
16	Bowl- Dixie Ultra Bowl 12oz Heavy	DIXSX812W	Dixie	SFI Certified	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 112.05	\$ 48.18	57%
17	Fork, Medium weight, White	WPL3540	Wallace	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 51.90	\$ 6.23	88%
18	Plate- Harvest® Fiber Plate Natural White 7in	GENHF807	Genpak	BPI Certified	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 73.91	\$ 34.00	54%
19	Knife, Medium weight, White	WPL3641	Wallace	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 13.19	\$ 6.20	53%
20	Lid 3-1/4 - 4 Oz Portion Cup Clear	SOLPL4N	Solo (Dart)	N/A	N/A	case	2500/ct	1 Case	\$ 94.50	\$ 35.91	62%
21	Lid Foam Container Vented White	DCC6JL	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 18.71	\$ 9.36	50%
22	Lid Foam Container Vented White	DCC8JL	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 19.51	\$ 9.56	51%
23	Lid Food Container Vented 1000	DCC20JL	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 33.87	\$ 15.92	53%
24	Lid Vented Bowl 6-14oz Cup White	DCC12JL	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	1000/ct	1 Case	\$ 25.65	\$ 12.06	53%
25	Foil- Medallion Foil Hd Foil 18in	HFA11807	Handi-Foil	N/A	N/A	case	1	1 Roll	\$ 89.78	\$ 35.90	60%
26	Paper Portion Cup 1oz White	GENF100	Genpak	BPI Certified	N/A	case	5000/ct	1 Case	\$ 86.88	\$ 29.54	66%
27	Plate, Unlaminated Foam 10-1/4 White	DCC10PWCR	Dart Container	N/A	N/A	case	500/ct	1 Case	\$ 41.65	\$ 16.24	61%

[illegible]